
BOARD OF PUBLIC WORKS AND SAFETY        (Form B-01-2012)  
Agenda Request Form  
  

Organizations and individuals are asked to submit a request form and supporting documents to 
be placed on the agenda. You will be contacted by the City confirming the date of the meeting in 
which your request will be heard. Please make sure that your contact information is accurate in 
case we need to get in touch with you. The Board of Works meets on the 1st and 3rd Monday of 
each month at 5:00 p.m. in City Hall located at 70 E. Monroe Street.  
   

Date Submitted: 03/28/2018 Meeting Date: 04/02/2018 

 

Contact Information:  

Requested by: Rick Littleton – DPW Superintendent 

 

On Behalf of Organization or Individual: Department of Public Works 

 

Telephone: 317-736-3640 

Email address: rlittleton@franklin.in.gov 

Mailing Address: 796 S. State Street 

 

Describe Request: 

Request to award contract for 2018 Sanitary Sewer Rehabilitation Project to Miller 
Pipeline as the lowest responsive and responsible bidder, and authorize the  

DPW Superintendent to issue Notice of Award and Notice to Proceed. 

List Supporting Documentation Provided: 

Review and Evaluation of Bids 

 

 

 

Who will present the request? 

Name:  Spencer Fairfax, B&V Engineers Telephone: 317-288-3959 

In order for an individual and/or agency to be considered for new business on the Board of Works 
agenda, this reservation form and supporting documents must be received in the Mayor’s office no 
later than 4:00 p.m. on the Wednesday before the meeting. 



Black & Veatch Corporation 
8415 Allison Pointe Boulevard, Suite 410 

P +1 317‐288‐3959 E GinnDH@bv.com 

 

March 26, 2018 
 
City of Franklin DPW  2018 Sanitary Sewer Rehabilitation Project 
796 S. State Street  B&V Project 185937 
Franklin, IN 46131  B&V File 42.0000 
   
Attention:  Mr. Rick Littleton 
  Superintendent 
 
Subject:  Review and Evaluation of Bids  for the 2018 Sanitary Sewer Rehabilitation Project   
 
Sealed Bids for the 2018 Sanitary Sewer Rehabilitation Project were received and opened at 10:00 a.m. 

on Wednesday, March 21, 2018, at Franklin City Hall, 70 East Monroe Street. Bids were received from 

four companies, Miller Pipeline, LLC, Layne Inliner, LLC, Insituform Technologies USA, LLC, and Robinson 

Pipe Cleaning Co.  

Base Bids submitted by the four companies ranged in price from $481,850.00 to $566,435.00. The 

Engineer’s opinion of probable construction cost for the Base Bid was $569,200.00. A tabulation of the 

four Bids is enclosed with this letter for your reference. The apparent low bidder with a lump sum Base 

Bid of $481,850.00 was Miller Pipeline, LLC. Additionally, Miller Pipeline, LLC submitted alternate bids 

for line items 3A through 7A for fold & form lining of sewer pipes as an alternative to cured‐in‐place‐

pipe (CIPP) lining of sewer pipes. If selected, the alternate bid items would reduce their Base Bid by 

$13,845.00. Miller Pipeline, LLC has also submitted all required documentation with its Bid and they 

appear to be satisfactory and in compliance with the Bidding Documents.  

Based on the results of the evaluation, it is recommended that Miller Pipeline, LLC be accepted for 

award as the lowest responsive and responsible bidder for the 2018 Sanitary Sewer Rehabilitation 

Project.   

Please let me know if you have any questions or need additional information.   

Sincerely, 

BLACK & VEATCH CORPORATION 
 

 
 
Donnie Ginn, P.E. 
Vice President 
 
Enclosures 

cc:  Evan Hart, Franklin DPW 

Spencer Fairfax, Black & Veatch 	



Bid Item 
Number

Description Quantity Unit
Unit Price for 

Item
Total Price for 

Item
Unit Price for 

Item
Total Price for 

Item
Unit Price for 

Item
Total Price for 

Item
Unit Price for 

Item
Total Price for 

Item
Unit Price for 

Item
Total Price for 

Item
1 Mobilization and Demobilization (Maximum 5% of Base Bid) 1 LS $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $19,100.00 $19,100.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
2 Maintenance of Traffic 1 LS $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $9,250.00 $9,250.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00
3 CIPP Sewer Lining, 6-inch Diameter 900 LF $35.00 $31,500.00 $36.75 $33,075.00 $30.00 $27,000.00 $29.50 $26,550.00 $28.00 $25,200.00
4 CIPP Sewer Lining, 8-inch Diameter 4,600 LF $30.00 $138,000.00 $22.00 $101,200.00 $27.00 $124,200.00 $23.75 $109,250.00 $26.00 $119,600.00
5 CIPP Sewer Lining, 10-inch Diameter 1,900 LF $33.00 $62,700.00 $26.75 $50,825.00 $30.00 $57,000.00 $26.00 $49,400.00 $27.00 $51,300.00
6 CIPP Sewer Lining, 12-inch Diameter 600 LF $38.00 $22,800.00 $37.35 $22,410.00 $40.00 $24,000.00 $40.00 $24,000.00 $31.00 $18,600.00
7 CIPP Sewer Lining, 15-inch Diameter 300 LF $43.00 $12,900.00 $42.00 $12,600.00 $50.00 $15,000.00 $55.00 $16,500.00 $36.00 $10,800.00
8 Sewer Point Repair w/ PVC Pipe, All Diameters, Up to 10-foot Length 6 EA $5,250.00 $31,500.00 $7,580.00 $45,480.00 $4,000.00 $24,000.00 $9,625.00 $57,750.00 $12,600.00 $75,600.00
9 Sewer Heavy Cleaning & Root Removal, All Diameters 2,800 LF $3.00 $8,400.00 $4.15 $11,620.00 $3.00 $8,400.00 $2.80 $7,840.00 $2.25 $6,300.00
10 Manhole Rehabilitation, Structural Lining, All Diameters 180 VLF $300.00 $54,000.00 $153.00 $27,540.00 $156.00 $28,080.00 $145.00 $26,100.00 $170.00 $30,600.00
11 Replace Manhole Frame and Cover 20 EA $1,100.00 $22,000.00 $1,320.00 $26,400.00 $1,444.00 $28,880.00 $1,350.00 $27,000.00 $1,500.00 $30,000.00
12 Install New Manufactured Internal Chimney Seal 9 EA $600.00 $5,400.00 $440.00 $3,960.00 $611.00 $5,499.00 $570.00 $5,130.00 $615.00 $5,535.00
13 Elevate Manhole to Grade 13 EA $1,000.00 $13,000.00 $1,100.00 $14,300.00 $389.00 $5,057.00 $365.00 $4,745.00 $2,600.00 $33,800.00
14 Manhole Defect Repair (Grouting, Frame Alignment, Laterals) 13 EA $1,000.00 $13,000.00 $1,320.00 $17,160.00 $605.00 $7,865.00 $310.00 $4,030.00 $1,200.00 $15,600.00
15 Replace Manhole, All Diameters 40 VLF $1,600.00 $64,000.00 $1,252.00 $50,080.00 $1,391.00 $55,640.00 $1,435.00 $57,400.00 $1,800.00 $72,000.00
16 Contingency Allowance 1 LS $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00

$569,200.00 $481,850.00 $489,121.00 $504,045.00 $566,435.00

ALTERNATE BID - FOLD & FORM LINING

Bid Item 
Number

Description Quantity Unit
Unit Price for 

Item
Total Price for 

Item
Unit Price for 

Item
Total Price for 

Item
Unit Price for 

Item
Total Price for 

Item
Unit Price for 

Item
Total Price for 

Item
Unit Price for 

Item
Total Price for 

Item
3A Fold & Form Sewer Lining, 6-inch Diameter 900 LF $30.00 $27,000.00 $34.00 $30,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4A Fold & Form Sewer Lining, 8-inch Diameter 4,600 LF $25.00 $115,000.00 $20.00 $92,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5A Fold & Form Sewer Lining, 10-inch Diameter 1,900 LF $28.00 $53,200.00 $26.35 $50,065.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6A Fold & Form Sewer Lining, 12-inch Diameter 600 LF $34.00 $20,400.00 $35.00 $21,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7A Fold & Form Sewer Lining, 15-inch Diameter 300 LF $40.00 $12,000.00 $42.00 $12,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Certified By:

Date:

Yes

TOTAL BASE BID:

CONTRACTOR NAME:
CONTRACTOR ADDRESS:

Form No. 96 w/ Non-Collusion Affidavit
Bid Bond

Acknowledgement of Addenda Received ( 1 )
Financial Statement

- Yes Yes Yes Yes
- Yes YesYes Yes

-

Contractor 4
Robinson Pipe Cleaning Co.

Indianapolis, IN 46250
Yes

Indianapolis, IN 46234
8415 Allison Pointe Blvd., Ste. 410 2656 Idlewood Road

- Yes

Contractor 1

Prepared By: Spencer Fairfax, Black & Veatch
Bids Received: March 21, 2018

BID TABULATION FORM
2018 SANITARY SEWER AND MANHOLE REHABILITATION PROJECT

Contractor 3

Yes Yes Yes

Miller Pipeline, LLC

Yes Yes

8850 Crawfordsville Road
Insituform Technologies USA, LLC

17988 Edison Avenue
Layne Inliner, LLC

CITY OF FRANKLIN, INDIANA

Engineer's Estimate
Black & Veatch

Contractor 2

Pittsburgh, PA 15205
4520 N State Road 37

Orleans, IN 47452 Chesterfield, MO 63005

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

List of Subcontractors - Yes Yes Yes Yes
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